
1. Introduction

An historical and bibliographical research into the
regulatory and practical relevance of natural parks in
Spain has contributed to the investigation and critical
analysis of the evolution of these protected areas.

In 1975 many protected areas in Spain were de-
clared “Nature Parks”. However, conceptual weak-
nesses in the definition of this designation, as well as
shortcomings in their establishment, led to their elimi-
nation as legal entities under Law 4/1989 dealing with
the conservation of protected areas and their flora and
fauna. Even though these “Nature Parks” no longer
exist in legal terms, the protected areas described still
do. Some, in fact, even retain this old epithet in their
current name. Law 4/1989 defines the term ‘Park’ as
“an area little modified for the purpose of human ex-
ploitation or occupation and which, given the beauty
of its landscape, the nature of its ecosystems or the
uniqueness of its flora or geomorphological forma-
tions, is of ecological, aesthetic, educational or scien-
tific value deserving of special attention.” 

According to the 1994 IUCN classification, “a pro-
tected area” is defined as an area of land and/or sea es-
pecially dedicated to the protection and maintenance
of biological diversity, and of natural and associated
cultural resources, managed through legal or other ef-
fective means [14]. This broad definition of protected
areas includes several categories, such as, among oth-
ers, total protection, referred to Strict Nature Re-

serves, ecosystem protection and tourism including
Nature and National Parks, or the conservation of nat-
ural characteristics, referred to Natural Monuments.
The essential aspect of all these categories is that the
area has to be managed in such a way as to ensure
long-term protection of its biodiversity. 

The category being analysed here, that of “Nature
Parks” is conceptually broader and less restrictive than
that of National Parks. While the later cover relatively
large surface areas, becoming protected areas due to
their qualified natural values (including landscape re-
sources) and with the main aim of facilitating contacts
between man and nature, a Nature Park, on the other
hand, enables reasonable use, within certain limits, of
the various resources. Consequently, one of the main
aims of a Nature Park is to harmonize the preservation
of environmental values with the orderly exploitation
of resources. At the same time, enjoyment and public
use must be combined in such a way as to endeavour
to maintain the original state of the area. 

In the IUCN classification it is implied that public
use is considered a form of managed use of an area
and a tool for stimulating income increasing of the lo-
cal population [3]. Consequently Spanish Nature Parks
correspond, to a great extent, to the category defined
by the IUCN as Protected Landscape/Seascapes since
they are identified with areas in which the methods 
of traditional exploitation by man have produced
ecosystems of great beauty associated with a rich bio-
diversity. 

The functions of Nature Parks should be: the con-
servation of nature, facilitating public use of the area
by visitors and enabling rural development of existing
villages. Consequently, the basic goal of planners and
managers of a protected area is to make these func-
tions compatible. This is a worldwide problem and
has always been a key issue for park managers and
planners. Limiting the use of natural resources and/or
prohibiting activities that are incompatible with the
status of protected areas has now become one of the
main issues for park managers. Noe et al. [18] have
analyzed this problem in three national parks in the
southeastern United States while White and Lovett
[20] have investigated the need to charge a fee for vis-
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itors to National Parks in the U.K. in order to provide
additional revenue for nature conservation and recre-
ation in the Parks. 

Nearly thirty million people visit Spain’s protected
areas every year, showing clearly that they are an im-
portant public attraction. Public use has been part of
the very concept of Nature Parks since they were first
conceived in the USA, and a central idea alongside
that of conservation. The recent definition of ‘public
use’ by EUROPARC-España moves in the same di-
rection: “The facilities, activities and services that, re-
gardless of who manages them, should be provided by
the administration of the protected area in order to in-
culcate in its visitors the necessary values [of conser-
vation]…” [8].

Taking stock of the resources offered by a natural
area, followed by their assessment and analysis, is the
starting point for the conservation of a protected area.
During the initial application of Law 4/1989, between
1989 and 1992, 32 Parks and 24 Reserves were estab-
lished. The first four Natural-Resource Plans (NRP)
were approved in 1992, but the original idea that such
plans be available before a Park be established did not
become the practice until very recently. According to
the EUROPARC-España Technical Department [12],
this reflects the historical lack of means for the pro-
tection of natural resources and conservation. In 1994,
with the multiplication of the number of protected ar-
eas, 46 new NRPs were approved. In 1999 there were
138 declared Parks (12 National Parks and 126 Nature
Parks), but only 60 (about 43%) had NRP’s in place.

Regarding the actual landscape-planning and pro-
tected areas system, two events were key in the con-
ception and developing culture of nature conservation.
The first was the introduction of the United Nations
Biodiversity Treaty at the UN Conference on Environ-
ment and Development in Rio de Janeiro in 1992. The
countries that signed the Treaty undertook to develop
strategies, plans or programmes for the sustainable
managment of biodiversity. It was proposed that the
signatories set up a system of protected areas in which
special measures would be taken to conserve biodiver-
sity, and where natural ecosystems and habitats would
be protected. Spain ratified the Treaty in 1994. The
second key event was the publication of European Di-
rective 92/43/EEC of the European Council of 21st
May 1992, concerning the conservation of natural
habitats and wildlife (hereafter referred to as the Habi-
tat Directive). Since this year it has been possible to
speak of a modern concept of planning for protected
areas with an integrated, global perspective.

The idea of preserving ‘natural islands’, first spo-
ken of in 1962, and the concept of conservation based
on the idea of “glass vases” free of human activity (a
model of conservation in which protection meant pro-
hibition) are now seen as hopelessly inefficient. Thir-
ty years later, the planning and management of pro-
tected areas was being approached from a radically
different perspective, i.e. considering them as part of
an environment in whose natural, social and economic

dynamics they participate [6].
The Habitat Directive understood the need to aban-

don the isolationist model of conservation, in which
planning strictly affected the protected area alone.
The new model of landscape planning considered the
territory as an integrated system and focused on the
influence of human activities on the protected area. A
further step was then taken which integrated these dif-
ferent areas into a network with the aim of encourag-
ing their conservation, and eventually allowing their
biological connection and physical continuity. The
idea was to overcome the concept of “islands of pro-
tection” and allow organisms to move from one pro-
tected area to another through natural or anthro-
pogenic corridors [15]. These links, often called eco-
logical corridors, together with core areas and step-
ping stones, constitute the main elements of ecologi-
cal networks [9]. In this context, environmental conti-
nuity and biopermeability play a very important role,
emphasizing the level of fragmentation of habitats
and the hampering effect of human settlements and
infrastructures [11].

Today, the ideals defended by the Habitat Directive
are well understood and are more or less practised by
the majority of EU Member States. In Spain, most of
the autonomous regions have already planned net-
work structures for their protected areas and have
passed the appropriate legislation, although a national
network that integrates and coordinates them all is
still to be developed. 

In any case, the protection provided for natural ar-
eas following normative designation is only passive,
limiting or preventing activities that might lead to
degradation. Such measures can only define an area
of land where attempts can be made to maintain the
natural equilibrium and biodiversity. More direct ac-
tion is required and other types of planning are need-
ed in order to achieve active management of resources
(active management being understood to mean: a
management plan with identified goals and supported
by sufficient material and human resources to attain
them).

2. Materials and methods

With reference to the topics presented in introduc-
tion, this study focused on the development of the ba-
sic instruments for managing Spain’s Nature Parks,
with a special focus on management related to public
use. In this context, different elements involved in the
management process for public use of Nature Parks
are investigated. This has allowed a management
model to be developed which can combine conserva-
tion and sustainable development of landscapes. The
methodology is based on the analysis of the main in-
struments and planning criteria regarding Spanish
Parks constituting reference elements for defining of a
sustainable management model of public use.

With regard to the organisation of defined natural
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areas, the basic planning instrument defined by Law
4/1989 is the Plan de Ordenación de los Recursos
Naturales i.e., the NRP. This was a novelty that tried
to combine two approaches to planning: 
a) The older Master Plan, Management Plan or

Guide Plan [17] system, collecting the documenta-
tion available at the time (without too much detail);

b) A more modern, dynamic and flexible approach
that continuously produces a large number of docu-
ments, but in an orderly manner, thus allowing its
revision and use, etc.
In its summary, Law 4/1989 defines an NRP as a

“flexible instrument allowing integrated treatment of
areas for conservation of those resources and species
whose protection is sought”. The importance of
NRP’s is such that the same Law states that they may
not be altered by any other instrument of territorial or
physical planning. An NRP is therefore an environ-
mental protection tool that approaches local-area
planning from the perspective of the appropriate use
of natural resources, and that classifies those areas to
be managed under one of the protection systems out-
lined by the Law.

Any conflict with urban interests should be solved
by the NRP. Such conflicts should be few, however,
since the land to be protected is usually classified (un-
der different names) as non-building land. 

An NRP should also reflect the social tendencies
and pressures of the area, which will undoubtedly
have an impact on later management.

A Usage and Management Plan (UMP) is the main
instrument that develops the information in the NRP.
It outlines how the latter will be used to manage the
protected area and achieve its goals. This terminology
(NRP, UMP) was actually a common feature of Span-
ish planning before Law 4/1989 was passed, but when
it came into force the UMP became subordinate to the
NRP. 

UMP’s were originated by Royal Decree 2676/
1977, when Law 15/1975 on Protected Natural Areas
come into effect. That law required State authorities
to take the necessary steps, via a Plan Director
(Guide Plan), to safeguard the characteristics and as-
sets motivating the creation of a National Park, to fa-
cilitate access to the area for its use and enjoyment,
and to prevent those activities that could affect it neg-
atively. The term Usage and Management Plan first
appeared in the laws that created (and later reclassi-
fied) the National Parks (1975), but it was not actually
used in practice until the creation of the Doñana and
Las Tablas de Daimiel Parks in 1978. Its institutional
use came about with Law 4/1989, although its charac-
ter was now substantially altered since it had become
an adjunct to the NRP. While an NRP is a document
for planning the uses of natural resources, the UMP
determines how these resources are to be protected.
According to Ruiz del Portal [19], the UMP is there-
fore “conservationist” in character.

Since the UMP regulates the activities of a protect-
ed area, reconciling the aims of research, public use

and conservation etc., it should be produced by the
body whose function it is to manage the area. Accord-
ing to Law 4/1989, Boards of Directors or Patronage
Boards may co-operate with park administration bod-
ies in this. Approval of the UMP is up to the appropri-
ate Regional Government (or a Management Com-
mission representing the different Autonomous Re-
gions whose borders a protected area might cross),
but it must be ratified by the State authorities. UMP’s
have a specified life span and must clearly state their
aims and priorities, the activities they envisage, and
the resources available to these ends. 

As specified in its Laws, Spain is politically and
legally structured in Autonomous Regions that have
produced their own legislation and planning instru-
ments. With reference to National Parks, the pioneer-
ing Regions in complementing Law 4/1989 were Cat-
alonia (which produced its own Special Protection
Plan and Annual Management Plan) and Andalusia
(which produced an Integral Development Plan and
Promotion Programme).

As mentioned above, planning criteria changed
substantially during the course of the 20th century.
Protectionist policies with reparative or corrective in-
tentions designed to repair damage that had already
occurred (and which gave no thought to any rational
management of the area) eventually gave way to pre-
ventive criteria that tried to minimise future damage
as much as possible (but which also gave no thought
to how the area might be used). Along these latter
lines, Carceller [4] wrote “Management of the envi-
ronment should be based on the principles of preven-
tive and corrective actions... It should try to avoid dis-
turbances or at least prevent disturbances from reach-
ing unacceptable levels rather than trying to repair
damage once it has been caused.”

Once consensus had been reached that the best way
to protect a natural area was through proper planning
and management, a great step forward was made. This
involved the incorporation of local-area planning tech-
niques, the idea of integrating protected areas, and the
introduction of predictive criteria. The latter are un-
derstood as criteria for measuring those variables
whose modification results in a change in the area
over time. They therefore underlie any management
plan in line with the needs of the protected area and its
users. Finally, up-grading criteria were introduced
with the aim of improving the adaptability, ability to
respond and/or reversibility of the environment.

The Spanish experience shows that the manage-
ment activities of a Nature Park should be more than
the simple protection of its resources. In France, the
planning of Nature Parks focuses particularly on land-
scape planning and on the improvement of rural life;
the conservation of nature is the responsibility of bod-
ies other than the Park. This, however, is not a com-
pletely integrated managerial approach. The truth is
that protected areas commonly require very complex
management involving the integration of many differ-
ent activities. If goals are to be met, planning the
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management of environmental resources (or other
types of heritage) is a necessity. 

From a planning point of view, the criteria behind
the designations Nature Park, Nature Reserve, Natural
Monument and Protected Landscape recognised by
Law 4/1989 can be perfectly extrapolated in respect
of one other. Nature Parks should be established along
with corresponding NRP’s. The NRP, or the UMP
which develops and establishes the NRP, should also
define the administration of the area’s resources. In
addition, classification of the area under one of the
Law’s designations implies that certain conditions
must be met: 
– Detection of the needs of the area to be protected;
– Identification of priorities;
– Listing of the available resources;
– Adoption of programmes;
– Evaluation of decisions taken.

Consequently, the following criteria should inspire
the planning process:
– Acting on consensus. Complementation and coor-

dination of political, administrative, sector and lo-
cal, environmental (conservation) and public (en-
joyment) interests. 

– Mediation. Continuous integration of existing or
foreseeable conflicts (detected through information
gathering) over resources, the reconciliation of
clashing plans and policies as well as problems
caused to industries etc. 

– Consultation. Clarifying the bases for decisions
made (which should be extensive knowledge of the
protected area and current circumstances).

– Monitoring and follow-up. Production of an inter-
active work system allowing the progressive attain-
ment of stated goals, albeit permitting reconsidera-
tion or correction and the incorporation of self-
monitoring mechanisms. 

– Development (as a consequence of the above) of
the norms and management programmes that make
it possible to attain goals and to administer the pro-
tected area.

– Maintaining the principles for which the area pro-
tection was sought: conservation, restoration and
the improvement of natural resources and cultural
values.
Management of protected areas ought to be possi-

ble with proper conceptual planning, however, the
practical application of management plans requires
flexibility and the training of qualified personnel who
can guarantee that goals will be attained.

3. Results and discussion

It is possible to explore different relations between
public and traditional use of Nature Parks in order to
define a new management model for their public use.

Since the break with the strict conservation poli-
cies that lasted until the end of the 20th century, the
most important factor in the planning of protected ar-

eas has been the large-scale incorporation of the idea
of ‘public use’.

Society’s attitude with regard to respect for the en-
vironment, the desire for contact with nature (which is
becoming more and more difficult in urban spaces)
and a maturing leisure culture (needed to reduce the
stress of modern life), have all been factors leading to
the growing number of visitors to areas of natural or
cultural heritage. Parks, under their different designa-
tions, have been in great demand.

A social need has arisen concerning the enjoyment
of natural areas – a need that is compatible with the
socio-economic requirements of populations living in
proximity of protected areas who wish to share the re-
wards that public use can bring. 

From a technical point of view, public use is under-
stood as the facilities, activities, and services to be
planned and managed in a protected area, so that visi-
tors are introduced to its natural and cultural values.
This will guarantee conservation of the area. Clearly,
National Parks are better equipped and better pre-
pared to manage public use, and although there are ar-
eas where improvement can be made, they have large-
ly solved the associated problems. Most of the re-
maining Nature Parks, however, have not been able to
adapt to current social demands: neither their govern-
ing authorities, their management resources, their fa-
cilities nor their infrastructures are capable of meeting
such needs. 

Tourism and the recreational use of a protected
area are factors that, when controlled, can have a
great beneficial impact on the socio-economic devel-
opment of the areas influenced by Parks. The difficul-
ty arises when trying to provide them with what they
need to deal satisfactorily with large numbers of visi-
tors, and when trying to make this new use compati-
ble with the interests of the resident population and
with the conservation of biodiversity. According to
data gathered by the Action Plan for Natural Areas
produced by EUROPARC-España, the number of vis-
itors to National Parks in 1984 was 2.4 million – a
figure that had more than quadrupled by 1999. Cur-
rently, the protected areas of Spain receive some 30
million visitors per year. Obviously, the material and
human resources of these areas have not increased at
the same pace. The public use of Parks as well as ru-
ral tourism (now very popular) require infrastructures
including hotels and other facilities allowing visitors
to enjoy their free time. The demand is growing, but
local governments in the proximity of Parks often do
not know how to meet it or are unable to do so.

The reason for these problems is poor (or even
non-existent) planning and inefficient management.
As mentioned above, the last ten years have seen
some improvement in the discrepancy between the
number of parks declared and the number which actu-
ally have an NRP, although much remains to be done.
This being the case with NRPs, it is easy to imagine
the state of management plans. At the same time, the
desire of some parks to normalize their situation has
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not been matched by the necessary political will to fi-
nance the stated objectives.

According to the Technical Department of EU-
ROPARC-España [12], 42.76% of Spanish Nature
Parks do not have a visitors’ centre and many have no
mapped-out routes and no information for visitors.
Some do not even have adequate sign-posting.

Until recently, tourism in Spain, both domestic and
international, has involved mainly the coastline (sun
and beaches) and movement towards the interior
(countryside and urban areas) has been noticed only
to a minor extent.

Nevertheless, the general social tendency towards
recovery of natural values and awareness of environ-
mental issues has generated a new type of tourism –
initially known as rural in Spain – involving the coun-
tryside and rural areas. This nature-based tourism, of-
ten called ecotourism or nature tourism is the fastest-
growing segment of tourism (WTTC, 2000). 

According to Heras [13], each country coins an ex-
pression in relation to the singularities of the country-
side involving the idea of activities developed in a ru-
ral area, and based on the use of human, natural and
material resources.

The European Union refers to this term as “the ac-
tivities developed in farms, agricultural exploitation
and activities performed out-of-doors in protected ar-
eas (environmentally protected areas, green tourism)
and the leisure activities carried out in urban and rural
areas, if they imply something other than simply visit-
ing a place”.

The fundamental aspects of this type of tourism
and on which its expansion and consolidation depend
are the following:
– improvement of the quality of the services, in rela-

tion to consumer comfort;
– implementation of these services with a variety of

leisure activities;
– controlled fees maintaining a high quality/price 

ratio;
– adapting equipment and resources to maintain a

more profitable “round-the-year” offer.
Townspeople are fascinated by the idea of going

“back to nature” and enjoying nature (fauna, flora and
country views), bike riding, hiking or the variety of
extreme sports etc. This coincides with a new way of
understanding and spending leisure time that require
planning and management of natural resources, in or-
der to guarantee their public use and softening the im-
pact these activities can produce on the environment.
The tourist industry has made an effort to integrate
this new management of protected areas in general,
and in particular of the Nature Parks. The actions un-
dertaken in this sector prove it.

The sustainability aspects of nature tourism and
ecotourism should include specific elements such as
conservation, community involvement, interpretation
and education, as well as environmental management
practices [21]. From this point of view, the planning
and management of a protected area must consider

both the need for conservation expressed by the local
population and the requests correlated with public
use. They must analyse the possibility of conflict and
its consequences and look for alternatives; in effect,
they must try to piece together the puzzle that a pro-
tected area is. The difficulty of this task increases dra-
matically when trying to reconcile the traditional in-
terests of the area with public use and enjoyment, and
when dealing with the many new factors such activi-
ties might introduce [16].

The key to success could reside in considering
public use as just another productive function of a
protected area, although subordinate to and condi-
tioned by other activities linked to its resources and
their exploitation. The environmental protection of an
area can never lead to the abandonment of its produc-
tivity or to prohibition of the activities carried on in-
side it [2]. This position strengthens the idea that pro-
tected areas should be integrated into their larger en-
vironments, and it clearly defends the idea of their use
and exploitation. Public use, understood as the recre-
ational use made of the area by its visitors, is also a
productive use to be incorporated into an area. So it
would make no sense at all to exclude the public from
the production process or to deny them access. How-
ever, such access should be compatible with conser-
vation of the area, and public and recreational use of
protected areas requires rules and regulations de-
signed to minimize its impact. 

At the beginning of the planning process, the plu-
rality of interests to be accommodated have to be set.
Such planning entails three major areas of interest:
– Local interests (detected in the analysis of re-

sources and in the plans of the various different in-
dustrial sectors);

– Interests more directly linked to the administrative
authorities, i.e., the more ‘institutional needs, e.g.,
conservation of the protected area and research etc.;

– Strictly public interests, i.e. those of the visitors.
These will entail investigating the Park’s (current
and potential) reception capacity, the consequent
analysis of existing infrastructures, how the area’s
resources and their vulnerability will be affected,
and the planning and programming of public use
activities. 
Involvement of the resident population from the in-

ception of the planning process will surely reveal any
conflicts of interest related to the traditional use of the
area. At the same time, the local population will be
constantly informed, and will become aware of the
economic and social benefits that protection of the
area could bring. 

It is in the management of public use, however,
that efficiency of planning is most easily measured.
Careful planning of public use, in line with local tra-
ditions, should provide adequate protection of the area
[16].

In this process the infrastructures should not be
considered an aim as such. Rather, they are the means
for implementing management of public use.
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Thus, a survey of the present and future reception
capacity of a Park will give rise to a list of shortages
and resource deficiencies. The planning of new areas
and uses will therefore confirm or deny the validity of
the existing infrastructures and buildings to be used
for the recreational activities.

Nevertheless, the final zoning programme will de-
pend on the detailed analysis of the capability of the
area to withstand that specific use, as well as on the
effect and impact of the programme on the quality
and fragility of the environment.

Aramburu [1] defines quality as the value due to
which an asset is worthy of protection, whereas
fragility or vulnerability is its capability of being dete-
riorated; it is a generic concept related to the system’s
reception capacity. In addition, García Moruno [10]
defines visual fragility as “the possibility of change
occurring in the landscape when it is subject to a spe-
cific use. It determines the degree of deterioration af-
fecting this landscape”.

These ideas can be applied perfectly to protected
areas in relation to the physical conditions as the land-
scape is one of the resources, and fragility is a generic
concept.

In later years the preoccupation with minimizing
the impact of human activities on the environment has
increased due to a greater social awareness of the
need to respect the environment. In other non-rural ar-
eas, this need is partially covered by the characteris-
tics of the urban environment, which is a very human-
dependent environment capable of absorbing the neg-
ative aspects in a “natural” way.

The increase in rural tourism and the need to be in
contact with nature, together with the recovery and
transformation of traditionally agricultural areas or
forests for leisure activities have become more signif-
icant. As a result, there is a need to maintain the func-
tionality of rural areas as well as to lower the percep-
tion of the anthropic landscape. There are many areas
which survive with the exploitation of soil resources,
and in which modification of the landscape with the
presence of buildings and constructions is inevitable.
New materials and construction techniques have led
to the proliferation of infrastructures and equipment,
which in many cases break up the original landscape
harmony. Thus, comprehension of environment, land-
scape and folklore have shaped the concept.

But landscape is at the same time the most appreci-
ated parameter in the appraisal of a protected natural
area [7], something needing further analysis.

Concern for the environment and landscape is now
part of the new sensibility of administrative authori-
ties, and as an example, we can refer to the European
Landscape Convention [5] signed by the members of
the European Council and listing all the causes of the
need for such a document.

The management of public use has to link together
the plans that have been developed and the principles
of “well-doing”, the good practices related to sustain-
ability.

The following are proposed as the principles that
should underlie this management. 
– The principle of submission. Actions should al-

ways be consistent with prior planning.
– The principle of shared responsibility. All the dif-

ferent parties involved in plans and programmes
should be responsible for management decisions
and actions. 

– Principle of instrumentation. This involves the
proper application of management criteria and in-
struments (preventive, corrective, curative, predic-
tive and encouraging [aimed at improving the
adaptability, capacity to respond and reversibility
of the natural environment]).

– Principle of sustainability. The use and develop-
ment of resources should follow solid criteria. All
activities should be integrated into the environ-
ment.

– Principle of globality. Local actions should always
incorporate a global perspective, which integrates
the protected area into the surrounding territory. 

– Principle of subordination. Problems should be
solved at the lowest level of responsibility possible.

– Principle of economy. “Economic is ecological”
and vice versa. 

– Principle of profitability. Investments, adjusted to
management and usage plans, should try to inter-
nalize the costs of exploiting and developing re-
sources, seeking profitability compatible with sus-
tainability. 

– Principle of quality. Quality in the service offered
should be a goal in all decisions. Follow-up and
evaluation is vital if quality is to be achieved.

4. Conclusions

The definition of a Nature Park maintains the idea
of a protected natural area whose management should
guarantee its conservation and preserve its resources,
yet allow an appropriate reconciliation of traditional
and public uses (including public enjoyment). Experi-
ence shows that this spirit has not always been main-
tained. Sometimes these areas have been converted
into areas of mere public use (peri-urban parkland) al-
though other areas have become National Parks or
Reserves. Anyway, it is not possible to state that there
has always been a balance between the three major is-
sues in the management of Nature Parks: promoting
conservation, developing the compatible use of re-
sources, and stimulating public use.

This research has shown that there are weaknesses
in the concept and use of the original designation ‘Na-
ture Park’ that Law 4/1989 has not been able to solve.
This specific designation was eliminated by this law
(although in practice the epithet often remained), and
these areas were reclassified under other designations
that afforded greater protection. Unfortunately, confu-
sion and poor practices continue under the new sys-
tem. In some cases the creation of a Nature Park has
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been used as a way to achieve rapid protection of an
area without the necessary planning. On other occa-
sions, the designation has been used as if it meant ‘Na-
tional Park’ but at a regional level. Yet other parks
have been declared as such without much justification.

Weaknesses exist in the management models for
these protected areas; indeed, good management is of-
ten lacking. Almost 60% of Nature Parks have no ap-
proved NRP or UMP. The two most common defi-
ciencies are a one-dimensional management focus,
i.e., management that does not take the different ac-
tivities that could be practised in these areas (e.g.,
conservation, public use and enjoyment) into account,
and a management model based on technical docu-
ments which does not consider the wishes of the local
population or of the broader community.

The concept of Nature Parks should be accompa-
nied by an improvement in the concept of NRP’s and
UMP’s, along with the development of new manage-
ment tools such as sector plans or specific pro-
grammes. As mentioned above, if goals are to be at-
tained, management tools, and in particular NRP’s,
should take different points of view into account.
Models are required that make management criteria
more homogeneous and that enable follow-up and
evaluation of actions taken.

In spite of the weaknesses described, Nature Parks
are important conservation assets. They are of huge
social value and are regarded as important attractions
by the general public [7]. The great dissatisfaction
that both residents and visitors often show with regard
to their management must, however, not be ignored.

Special attention should be paid to the idea that,
given their isolation, Nature Parks need to be more
than simple instruments of conservation. Rather, they
should be seen as social intervention programmes that
consider the needs of different communities, even in-
volving them from the very beginning of planning.
Planning and management should consider compensa-
tion for local populations, and be linked with pro-
grammes of sustainable development in the areas of
which they are part.

Nature Parks are favourite places for learning,
dealing with nature, and just getting away from it all
[7]. The quality of a visit is closely related to the qual-
ity of the Park itself, to the information received on
the natural resources of the area and, above all, to the
explanatory facilities available. Most people regard a
visit to a Nature Park as a positive experience, but
there are enormous differences between the facilities
available for public use at different parks. Thus, an
adequate and consistent programme for monitoring
and evaluating the quality of Park visits need to be de-
veloped.
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SUMMARY

The great change in the management of protected
areas over the last forty years has been a shift in focus
from what happens within Park boundaries to what
happens outside them but necessarily influences what
goes on inside them. Once treated as treasures to be

isolated and protected from all interference, the pres-
ent consensus is that Nature Parks should be consid-
ered an integral part of the economic, ecological and
social dimensions of the local area to which they be-
long. This research paper proposes a working model
for Park managers and planners able to reconcile the
need for conservation with sustainable development of
the area. Public use and enjoyment of protected areas
is not only compatible with conservation but is essen-
tial to both preservation and to integration of the Park
into its local area. Making conservation compatible
with traditional uses of resources and with public use
and enjoyment, encouraging all the parties concerned
to be involved in planning and decision-making, and
inculcating a ‘culture of conservation’ may make the
goal of preserving protected areas easier to attain. 

Key words: Nature Parks, protected areas, resource
planning, landscape management, ecotourism.
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